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◊ We have been invited to attend another train show.  
Following is the e-mail that was received.  We can 
attend as a club or individual members can contact 
Andre’s to attend: 

 
Subject: Ann Arbor Model Railroad Club 2005 Train Show 
 
The Ann Arbor Model Railroad Club is sponsoring its 35th 
annual Train Show and Sale.  We are planning on featuring 
a 127 module N-trak layout and would like to invite you to 
participate.  The show is February 19th & 20, 2005 in Saline 
Michigan.  If you could contact me and let me know if 
anyone in your organization would like to attend, I would 
greatly appreciate it.  Thank you for your time and I am 
looking forward to hearing from you. 
  
Sincerely, 
  
Andre' Torres 
Show Chairman 
showinfo@aamrc.org 



3 

Lake Erie N Scale Society 

Last Month’s Meeting 

This Month’s Meeting 

Richard F. has volunteered to host our meeting this month.  
We will be finalizing the plans for the Burton Layout and 
Farmpark setups.  As always, this being the “busy” season 
of our calendar, we will need everyone to provide as much 
time to our activities as possible to make them successful. 
 
Richard’s layout is setup for DCC.  If you have a Digitrax 
controller, please bring it along for the operating session.  I 
believe guest trains will be welcomed.   

Next Month’s Meeting 

Thanks to Wayne and Bonnie L. for hosting the meeting 
and demonstrating their home layout.  We discussed plans 
for future setups at Burton and Farmpark.  We were also 
invited to submit a bid to build an N scale layout in Mentor.   

Traditionally, we have been meeting in Burton, Ohio for 
nearly 20 years.  This year we will have a display in the 
Library on the town square.   
 
Setup is the day after Thanksgiving at the Library. 
 
(As usual, the layout is an excuse to meet at Belle’s 
Restaurant to eat pie after the setup on Friday.) 
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